
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT 93 

20-2124_1679



20-2124_1680



20-2124_1681



20-2124_1682



20-2124_1683



20-2124_1684



20-2124_1685



20-2124_1686



20-2124_1687





20-2124_1689



20-2124_1690



20-2124_1691



20-2124_1692



20-2124_1693



20-2124_1694



20-2124_1695



20-2124_1696



20-2124_1697



20-2124_1698



20-2124_1699



20-2124_1700



20-2124_1701



20-2124_1702



20-2124_1703



20-2124_1704



20-2124_1705



20-2124_1706



20-2124_1707



20-2124_1708



20-2124_1709



20-2124_1710



20-2124_1711



 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT 94 

20-2124_1712



20-2124_1713



20-2124_1714



 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT 95 

20-2124_1715



20-2124_1716



20-2124_1717



20-2124_1718



20-2124_1719



20-2124_1720



20-2124_1721



20-2124_1722



20-2124_1723



20-2124_1724



20-2124_1725



20-2124_1726



20-2124_1727



20-2124_1728



20-2124_1729



20-2124_1730



20-2124_1731



20-2124_1732



20-2124_1733



20-2124_1734



20-2124_1735



20-2124_1736



20-2124_1737



20-2124_1738



20-2124_1739



20-2124_1740



20-2124_1741



20-2124_1742



20-2124_1743



 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT 96 

20-2124_1744



20-2124_1745



 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT 97 

20-2124_1746



20-2124_1747



 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT 98 

20-2124_1748



KD_0001

20-2124_1749



 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT 99 

20-2124_1750



From: Steven Palazzo
Subject: PFC AMEX Cards
Date: Sunday, June 28, 2020 3:58:17 PM

Team P, 

In an effort to strengthen our internal controls we will be freezing all AMEX cards within 30
days.  Please identify any official campaign monthly re-occurring charges that are on the card
as we will need to direct them to the primary card holder.

Also this is a good time to assess if we still need those services and please let us know what
those services are for.

Authorized and official campaign expense reimbursements will be completed by filling out an
expense reimbursement form and attaching receipts that provide details of the purchase so
our treasurer can accurately identify the transaction for reporting purposes.

Any questions please contact myself or Hunter or myself.

Regards,

Steven

THSP_1648

20-2124_1751



 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT 100 

20-2124_1752



From: Cameron Bell
To: Brown, Jeffrey
Subject: FW: River House
Date: Monday, July 6, 2020 1:47:36 PM
Attachments: image001.jpg

ATT00001.htm
3865 001.pdf
ATT00002.htm

 
 
Cameron C. Bell
Realtor l Broker l Attorney*
Cameron Bell Properties, Inc.
14335 Dedeaux Road
Gulfport, MS  39503
Cell   
Fax   (800) 520-3445
www.cameronbellproperties.com
 
*Not actively practicing law.
 

From: Z112 Palazzo, Steven < > 
Sent: Thursday, February 22, 2018 2:58 PM
To: cameronbel
Subject: Fwd: River House
 
 

Sent from my iPad

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Philpot, Maurine" < >
Date: February 22, 2018 at 2:56:19 PM CST
To: "Z112 Palazzo, Steven" < >
Subject: River House

Per your request
 

C. Maurine Bruner-Philpot
Constituent Liaison
Hattiesburg Office
 
641 Main St., Suite 142
Hattiesburg, MS 39401
Phone: (601) 582-3246
Fax: (601) 582-3452

CB_0349

20-2124_1753



 
http://palazzo.house.gov/forms/emailsignup/
 

Virus-free. www.avg.com

CB_0350

20-2124_1754



CB_0351

20-2124_1755



CB_0352

20-2124_1756



CB_0353

20-2124_1757



CB_0354

20-2124_1758



CB_0355

20-2124_1759



CB_0356

20-2124_1760



CB_0357

20-2124_1761



CB_0358

20-2124_1762



 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT 101 

20-2124_1763



From: Cameron Bell
To: Brown, Jeffrey
Subject: FW: 2 documents
Date: Monday, July 6, 2020 1:47:42 PM
Attachments: image001.gif

ATT00001.htm
image002.jpg
ATT00002.htm
River House [CSP].pdf
ATT00003.htm
Hickman [CSP].pdf
ATT00004.htm

 
 
Cameron C. Bell
Realtor l Broker l Attorney*
Cameron Bell Properties, Inc.
14335 Dedeaux Road
Gulfport, MS  39503
Cell   
Fax   (800) 520-3445
www.cameronbellproperties.com
 
*Not actively practicing law.
 

From: Z112 Palazzo, Steven < > 
Sent: Wednesday, February 21, 2018 11:59 AM
To: cameronbel
Subject: Fwd: 2 documents
 
Check these over and let’s get them up today.  
 
Farm $425K
River House $525K 
 
Thanks.
 
SMP
 
Sent from my iPad

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Philpot, Maurine" < >
Date: February 21, 2018 at 11:51:39 AM CST
To: "Z112 Palazzo, Steven"
< >
Subject: 2 documents

CB_0364

20-2124_1764



20-2124_1765



CB_0366

20-2124_1766



CB_0367

20-2124_1767



CB_0368

20-2124_1768



CB_0369

20-2124_1769



CB_0370

20-2124_1770



CB_0371

20-2124_1771



CB_0372

20-2124_1772



CB_0373

20-2124_1773



CB_0374

20-2124_1774



CB_0375

20-2124_1775



CB_0376

20-2124_1776



CB_0377

20-2124_1777



CB_0378

20-2124_1778



CB_0379

20-2124_1779



CB_0380

20-2124_1780



CB_0381

20-2124_1781



CB_0382

20-2124_1782




